



SOUTH FLORIDA WATER MANAGEMENT DISTRICT

NOTICE OF INTENT TO AWARD

RFB No.: 600000181 Title: Gasoline (Regular, Unleaded) and Diesel Fuel (No. 2, Ultra Low Sulphur)
SBE Availability (%): Opening Date: June 18, 2008 at 2:00 p.m.
Total Bids Received: 4 Advertised date: May 19, 2008
Bids Received from SBEs: 0 Advertised in: PB Daily Business Review, Ft. Lauderdale Sun Sentinel, Orlando Sentinel
Total Bid Packages Mailed: 0
Bid Packages Mailed to SBEs: 0
No-Bids Received: 2 Purchasing Agent: Sebastian Carta
No Answers: 4 Project Manager: Jerry Rude

Table with 3 columns: BIDDERS, BID AMOUNT, MEETS DISTRICT SPECS - YES/NO. Bidders listed include MacMillan Oil Co. of Florida, SSI Petroleum, BV Oil Co. Inc., and Palmdale Oil Co. Inc. Bid amounts are indicated as 'SEE ATTACHED SPREADSHEET'.

The bid amounts indicated above are as submitted at the bid opening and are subject to verification. Award to the lowest bidder is subject to the District's determination that the bid is responsive and that the bidder is responsible as indicated by the signatures below.

Approvals required in numerical order. Signatures must be dated.

Project Manager - Attach detailed justification that recommended bidder is responsive and responsible.

1. Project Manager Date

Recommendation for award to low bidder?

Yes No

2. Department Director Date

3. Deputy Executive Director (Resource Area) Date

If no, recommend award to:

4. Purchasing Agent Date

Basis of recommendation:

5. Purchasing Manager Date

6. Gatekeeper* Date

7. Office of Counsel * Date

Governing Board approval of award or contract required?

Yes No

8. Procurement Director Date

9. District Leadership Team** Date

*Signature only required when recommendation of award is to (a) other than low bid (when low bidder has been deemed non-responsive and/or non-responsible), or (b) when only one bid is received. PA or PM must provide backup as appropriate in all cases. (Insert N/A if not applicable.)

**Signature only required in the event the threshold requires approval of the award by the Governing Board

NOTE: This form shall serve as the District's Notice of a decision or intended decision as defined in Section 120.57(3)(a) F.S., and Chapter 28-110, Florida Administrative Code (F.A.C.). Failure to timely file with the District Clerk a notice of intent to protest, or a formal written protest with a bond, as prescribed in Section 120.57(3), F.S., and Section 287.042(2)(c), F.S., shall constitute a waiver of proceedings under Chapter 120, F.S.

Posting Date:
Posting Time:
Initials:

BID TABULATION

RFB 6000000181 GASOLINE AND DIESEL FUEL

DATE: JUNE 18, 2008

BIDDER:	Macmillan Oil	SSI	BV OIL	PALMDALE
UNLEADED FUEL:	<u>FIXED PRICE INCREMENT</u>	<u>FIXED PRICE INCREMENT</u>	<u>FIXED PRICE INCREMENT</u>	<u>FIXED PRICE INCREMENT</u>
MIAMI FIELD STATION	\$0.06900	\$0.05900	\$0.16000	\$0.15740
HOMESTEAD FIELD STATION	\$0.07800	\$0.08300	\$0.18000	\$0.18090
FT. LAUDERDALE FIELD STATION	\$0.07800	\$0.05800	\$0.14000	\$0.13680
CLEWISTON FIELD STATION	\$0.13500	\$0.09900	\$0.67000	\$0.16400
OKEECHOBEE FIELD STATION	NO BID	\$0.12500	\$0.88000	\$0.10110
FT. PIERCE SUB-STATION	NO BID	\$0.15900	\$1.07000	\$0.20810
KISSIMMEE FIELD STATION	NO BID	\$0.24900	\$0.89000	\$0.19120
WEST PALM BEACH FIELD STATION	\$0.08700	\$0.07800	\$0.25000	\$0.08690
PUMP STATION S-5A	NO BID	\$0.11900	\$0.25000	\$0.31330
DUPUIS RESERVE	NO BID	\$0.25700	\$1.10000	\$0.26580

#2 DIESEL FUEL	<u>FIXED PRICE INCREMENT</u>	<u>FIXED PRICE INCREMENT</u>	<u>FIXED PRICE INCREMENT</u>	<u>FIXED PRICE INCREMENT</u>
MIAMI FIELD STATION	\$0.06900	\$0.05900	\$0.14500	\$0.15740
HOMESTEAD FIELD STATION	\$0.07800	\$0.08300	\$0.18000	\$0.18090
FT. LAUDERDALE FIELD STATION	\$0.07800	\$0.05800	\$0.14000	\$0.13680
CLEWISTON FIELD STATION	\$0.13500	\$0.09900	\$0.67000	\$0.16400
OKEECHOBEE FIELD STATION	NO BID	\$0.12500	\$0.88000	\$0.10110
FT. PIERCE SUB-STATION	NO BID	\$0.15900	\$1.07000	\$0.20810
KISSIMMEE FIELD STATION	NO BID	\$0.24900	\$0.89000	\$0.19120
WEST PALM BEACH FIELD STATION	\$0.08700	\$0.07800	\$0.25000	\$0.08690
PUMP STATION S-5A	N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A
DUPUIS RESERVE	NO BID	\$0.25700	\$1.10000	\$0.26580