June 24th, 2009

Bid 60000000270, Bid Tabulation

CO. NAME B. V. OIL PALMDALE OIL MACMILLAN OIL S S| PETROLEUM

LOCATION Fixed Price Increment (+) Fixed Price Increment (+) Fixed Price Increment (+) Fixed Price Increment (+)
1 S-13 (1) $0.01190 $0.01490 (2) $0.01600 $0.01360
2 S-9/S9A (1) $0.01371 $0.02190 (2) $0.01700 $0.01550
3 S-140 (1) $0.02378 $0.02560 (2) $0.01800 $0.02390
4 S-8 (1) $0.02190 $0.02390 (2) $0.01800 $0.02290
5 G-404 $0.02971 (1) $0.02390 (2 $0.01800 $0.02420
6 S-331 (1) $0.02813 $0.03860 (2 $0.02700 $0.02950
7 S-332D (1) $0.02830 $0.04490 (2 $0.02700 $0.03200
8 S-332B $0.02830 $0.04490 (2) $0.02700 (1) $0.02600
9 S-356 $0.02693 $0.03490 (2 $0.02600 (1) $0.02000
10 S-332C $0.02913 $0.04460 (2) $0.02700 (1) $0.02850
11 S-25B $0.03320 $0.04720 (2 $0.04700 (1) $0.02900
12 S-26B $0.03520 $0.04430 (2) $0.04700 (1) $0.02900
13 G-420 $0.03800 $0.06830 (2 $0.06700 (1) $0.02900
14 G-422 $0.03490 $0.04590 (2 $0.05700 (1) $0.02900
15 S-357 $0.03610 $0.03930 (2) $0.06400 (1) $0.03200
16 S-4 $0.04250 (1) $0.03760 (2) No Bid $0.04100
17 S-137 $0.40000 $0.05560 (2) No Bid (1) $0.04500
18 S-131 $0.40000 $0.06560 (2) No Bid 1) $0.06200
19 S-129 $0.40972 (1) $0.05560 (2) No Bid $0.06200
20 G-349A $0.75000 $0.30000 (2) No Bid (1) $0.25000
21 G-409 $0.75000 $0.07090 (2) No Bid D) $0.05250
22 G-349C $0.75000 $0.30000 (2) No Bid (1) $0.05200
23 G-350A $0.75000 $0.30000 (2) No Bid D) $0.05200
24 S-135 $0.60000 (1) $0.04880 (2) No Bid $0.05800
25 S-133 $0.05800 (1) $0.05280 (2) No Bid $0.05800
26 S-2 (1) $0.02210 $0.03340 (2) $0.03700 $0.02350
27 S-5A $0.02290 $0.03390 (2) $0.03700 (1) $0.02000
28 S-3 (1) $0.03120 $0.03690 (2) $0.03700 $0.03300
29 S-6 $0.03570 $0.03390 (2) $0.03700 (1) $0.03200
30 S-7 $0.02010 $0.02230 (2 $0.02300 (1) $0.01850
31 G-310 $0.03330 $0.03390 (2 $0.03700 (1) $0.03250
32 G-335 (1) $0.02600 $0.02690 (2) $0.03700 $0.03400
33 G-337 $0.05400 $0.05250 (2 $0.07700 (1) $0.03950
34 S-319 (1) $0.02210 $0.03390 (2) $0.03700 $0.03100
35 S-362 (1) $0.02210 $0.03390 (2 $0.03700 $0.03100
36 S-361 $0.40000 $0.11210 (2) No Bid 1) $0.04100
37 G-370 $0.02610 $0.02230 (2 $0.02700 (1) $0.02200
38 G-372 (1) $0.02620 $0.02880 (2 $0.02700 $0.02890
39 G-700 $0.75000 (1) $0.25000 (2 No Bid $0.60000
40 G-382 $0.06800 (1) $0.05230 (2) No Bid $0.06000

Note: (1) Award being made at the location specified

(2) No award being made - Macmillan Oil Company was deemed nonresponsive for not complying with the minimum Cetane rating
(reference RFB, page 23 of 34)
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